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The United Fruit Company (UFCO) developed an unprecedented relationship with Guatemala in the first
half of this century. By 1944, UFCO owned 566,000 acres, employed 20,000 people, and operated 96% of
Guatemala's 719 miles of railroad, making the multinational corporation Guatemala's largest private
landowner and biggest employer. In Doing Business with the Dictators, Paul J. Dosal shows how UFCO
built up a profitable corporation in a country whose political system was known to be corrupt. His work is
based largely on research of company documents recently acquired from the Justice Department under the
Freedom of Information Act-no other historian researching this topic has looked at these sources. As a result,
Dr. Dosal is able to offer the first documentary evidence of how UFCO acquired, defended, and exploited its
Guatemalan properties by collaborating with successive authoritarian regimes.
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From reader reviews:

Sharon Hall:

Book will be written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can realize everything you want by a book.
Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Next to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A publication Doing Business with the Dictators: A
Political History of United Fruit in Guatemala, 1899-1944 (Latin American Silhouettes) will make you to
end up being smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about almost everything. But
some of you think this open or reading the book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they might be
thought like that? Have you searching for best book or ideal book with you?

Jack Alexandre:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just
watching TV, or perhaps playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that's
look different you can read any book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you read you
can spent the entire day to reading a e-book. The book Doing Business with the Dictators: A Political History
of United Fruit in Guatemala, 1899-1944 (Latin American Silhouettes) it is quite good to read. There are a
lot of folks that recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. In case you did not
have enough space to deliver this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this
book from a smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book possesses high quality.

Megan Rivera:

Why? Because this Doing Business with the Dictators: A Political History of United Fruit in Guatemala,
1899-1944 (Latin American Silhouettes) is an unordinary book that the inside of the publication waiting for
you to snap it but latter it will shock you with the secret that inside. Reading this book alongside it was
fantastic author who also write the book in such remarkable way makes the content inside easier to
understand, entertaining approach but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good for you for not hesitating
having this ever again or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you a lot of rewards than the
other book include such as help improving your expertise and your critical thinking technique. So , still want
to hold off having that book? If I had been you I will go to the reserve store hurriedly.

Joshua Nichols:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to decide on book
like comic, quick story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not trying Doing Business with
the Dictators: A Political History of United Fruit in Guatemala, 1899-1944 (Latin American Silhouettes) that
give your entertainment preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading behavior all over
the world can be said as the opportinity for people to know world considerably better then how they react to



the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading habit only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants
to always be success person. So , for all of you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you can pick
Doing Business with the Dictators: A Political History of United Fruit in Guatemala, 1899-1944 (Latin
American Silhouettes) become your starter.
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