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Boost your organization's growth by incorporating networking in the DevOps culture

About This Book

Implement networking fundamentals to the DevOps culture with ease, improving your organization's●

stability
Leverage various open source tools such as Puppet and Ansible in order to automate your network●

This step-by-step learning guide collaborating the functions of developers and network administrators●

Who This Book Is For

The book is aimed for Network Engineers, Developers, IT operations and System admins who are planning
to incorporate Networking in DevOps culture and have no knowledge about it.

What You Will Learn

Learn about public and private cloud networking using AWS and OpenStack as examples●

Explore strategies that can be used by engineers or managers to initiate the cultural changes required to●

enable the automation of network functions
Learn about SDN and how an API-driven approach to networking can help solve common networking●

problems
Get the hang of configuration management tools, such as Ansible and Jenkins, that can be used to●

orchestrate and configure network devices
Setup continuous integration, delivery, and deployment pipelines for network functions●

Create test environments for network changes●

Understand how load balancing is becoming more software defined with the emergence of microservice●

applications

In Detail

Frustrated that your company's network changes are still a manual set of activities that slow developers
down? It doesn't need to be that way any longer, as this book will help your company and network teams
embrace DevOps and continuous delivery approaches, enabling them to automate all network functions.

This book aims to show readers network automation processes they could implement in their organizations.
It will teach you the fundamentals of DevOps in networking and how to improve DevOps processes and
workflows by providing automation in your network. You will be exposed to various networking strategies
that are stopping your organization from scaling new projects quickly.

You will see how SDN and APIs are influencing DevOps transformations, which will in turn help you
improve the scalability and efficiency of your organizations networks operations. You will also find out how
to leverage various configuration management tools such as Ansible, to automate your network.



The book will also look at containers and the impact they are having on networking as well as looking at
how automation impacts network security in a software-defined network.

Style and approach

This will be a comprehensive, learning guide for teaching our readers how networking can be leveraged to
improve the DevOps culture for any organization.
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From reader reviews:

Winston Nakashima:

Now a day people who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources included can be true or not call for people to be aware of each facts they get. How individuals to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading
through a book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information specially this DevOps for Networking book
as this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred per-cent
guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Virginia Doak:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside together with friends, fun activity having family
or just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by reading through a
book. Ugh, do you think reading a book can really hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It
fine you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like DevOps for Networking
which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.

Scott Schiller:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got college students? We believe that that
query was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And
you know that little person like reading or as studying become their hobby. You have to know that reading is
very important along with book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to include you knowledge, except
your personal teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update about something by book. Amount
types of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is niagra DevOps for Networking.

Michelle Garrett:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information coming
from a book. Book is written or printed or illustrated from each source in which filled update of news.
Within this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media
social just like newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or
just looking for the DevOps for Networking when you necessary it?
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